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Abstract 
 
I will use this colloquium as an opportunity to 
introduce the motivation, approach, and 
portfolio of research we have developed at 
AFRL’s Cognitive Models and Agents Branch 
over the course of the last decade. A prominent 
feature of our approach is an emphasis on 
computational cognitive process modeling, 
especially in the context of cognitive 
architecture, so I will provide some background 
and history on that scientific perspective. 
Recently we have begun exploring the use of 
technologies and methods that are increasing 
the pace of our modeling progress. These 
include high performance and volunteer 
computing, stochastic sampling and predictive 
analytics, and dynamic visualization of 
interacting parameter spaces. The general 
point, which I hope to use to generate some 
constructive (and perhaps controversial) 
discussion, is that the cognitive science 
community needs a more efficient and 
productive infrastructure for achieving 
theoretical breadth and integration in 
mathematical and computational modeling. 
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